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Here Roland Omnès offers a clear, up-to-date guide to the conceptual framework of quantum mechanics. In
an area that has provoked much philosophical debate, Omnès has achieved high recognition for his
Interpretation of Quantum Mechanics (Princeton 1994), a book for specialists. Now the author has
transformed his own theory into a short and readable text that enables beginning students and experienced
physicists, mathematicians, and philosophers to form a comprehensive picture of the field while learning
about the most recent advances.

This new book presents a more streamlined version of the Copenhagen interpretation, showing its logical
consistency and completeness. The problem of measurement is a major area of inquiry, with the author
surveying its history from Planck to Heisenberg before describing the consistent-histories interpretation. He
draws upon the most recent research on the decoherence effect (related to the modern resolution of the
famous Schrödinger's cat problem) and an exact formulation of the correspondence between quantum and
particle physics (implying a derivation of classical determinism from quantum probabilism).

Interpretation is organized with the help of a universal and sound language using so-called consistent
histories. As a language and a method, it can now be shown to be free of ambiguity and it makes
interpretation much clearer and closer to common sense.
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From reader reviews:

Claudia Weidner:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim as well as goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is usually reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem as well as exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Understanding Quantum Mechanics.

Daniel Martin:

With other case, little persons like to read book Understanding Quantum Mechanics. You can choose the
best book if you want reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a new book
Understanding Quantum Mechanics. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world
with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can recognize everything! From your country
until finally foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you
may know that. In this era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You
may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Francis Corder:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
need something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy
man? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time?
What did you do? All people has many questions above. They need to answer that question mainly because
just their can do in which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is appropriate.
Because start from on guardería until university need this specific Understanding Quantum Mechanics to
read.

Antonio Sisson:

The guide with title Understanding Quantum Mechanics contains a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This kind of book exist new information
the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world today. That is important
to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of the
syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.
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