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Business growth and client relationship management are two key components to a thriving law practice. In
The Lawyer’s Field Guide to Effective Business Development, Second Edition, Flannery proves that any
lawyer can be effective as a client relationship manager and advocate. This practical guide shares detailed
and sensible tactics for winning and retaining long-term, profitable clients in an increasingly competitive and
changing legal market.

What has changed since the first edition is not the message, but the market. Since the Great Recession,
businesses have adapted the ways they purchase legal services and firms have changed the way they compete
for work. Through the knowledge and skills shared in this book combined with a little courage and diligence,
any lawyer will be prepared to not just survive this “new normal,” but succeed.

The Field Guide is designed for seasoned lawyers who want to refine and polish their business development
skills, as well as younger lawyers who have set their sights on designing successful and profitable careers as
trusted advisors.
Keep this guide on hand – this advice may come in handy just when you need a boost.
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Trimm:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and advance. Some of
you maybe will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the
problems coming to an individual is you don't know what type you should start with. This The Lawyer's
Field Guide to Effective Business Development is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the
world. Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Dorothy Tran:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love The Lawyer's Field Guide to
Effective Business Development, you could enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still desire to miss
it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't have it, oh come
on its called reading friends.

Andrew Fox:

The book untitled The Lawyer's Field Guide to Effective Business Development contain a lot of information
on the idea. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very clear and understandable
all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author.
The author will bring you in the new period of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can
continue reading your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If
you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go
through.

Chris Boos:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Lawyer's Field Guide to Effective
Business Development was bright colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book The
Lawyer's Field Guide to Effective Business Development has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until
adolescents. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and think that you are the character on
there. So , not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to
choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that will.
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