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Part of the Reacting to the Past series, Confucianism and the Succession Crisis of the Wanli Emperor
brings to life the suppleness and power of Confucian thought.

The game is set in the Hanlin Academy in Ming dynasty China. Most students are members of the Grand
Secretariat of the Hanlin Academy, the body of top-ranking graduates of the civil service examination who
serve as advisers to the Wanli emperor. Some Grand Secretaries are Confucian “purists,” who hold that
tradition obliges the emperor to name his first-born son as successor; others, in support of the most senior of
the Grand Secretaries, maintain that it is within the emperor’s right to choose his successor; and still others,
as they decide this matter among many issues confronting the empire, continue to scrutinize the teachings of
Confucianism for guidance. The game unfolds amidst the secrecy and intrigue within the walls of the
Forbidden City, as scholars struggle to apply Confucian precepts to a dynasty in peril.

Reacting to the Past is a series of historical role-playing games that explore important ideas by re-creating
the contexts that shaped them. Students are assigned roles, informed by classic texts, set in particular
moments of intellectual and social ferment. 

An award-winning active-learning pedagogy, Reacting to the Past improves speaking, writing, and
leadership skills, promotes engagement with classic texts and history, and builds learning communities.
Reacting can be used across the curriculum, from the first-year general education class to “capstone”
experiences. A Reacting game can also function as the discussion component of lecture classes, or it can be
enlisted for intersession courses, honors programs, and other specialized curricular purposes.
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From reader reviews:

Flora Godfrey:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for all of us. The book Confucianism and the Succession Crisis of the
Wanli Emperor, 1587 (Reacting to the Past) has been making you to know about other understanding and of
course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The e-book Confucianism and the
Succession Crisis of the Wanli Emperor, 1587 (Reacting to the Past) is not only giving you far more new
information but also to become your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your current spend time to
read your guide. Try to make relationship with the book Confucianism and the Succession Crisis of the
Wanli Emperor, 1587 (Reacting to the Past). You never feel lose out for everything when you read some
books.

Joseph Vargas:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
any time those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which
one is acceptable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Confucianism and the Succession Crisis of the Wanli
Emperor, 1587 (Reacting to the Past) as the daily resource information.

Lionel Gutierrez:

This book untitled Confucianism and the Succession Crisis of the Wanli Emperor, 1587 (Reacting to the
Past) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, here is because when you read this guide you can
get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it by
using online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because
you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you to past this guide from your list.

David Murray:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is known as of book
Confucianism and the Succession Crisis of the Wanli Emperor, 1587 (Reacting to the Past). You can include
your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and
make anyone happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one
place to other place.
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