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Since 1972, the Rainbow Family of Living Light, a loosely organized and anarchistic nomadic community,
have been holding large gatherings in remote forests to pray for world peace and create a model of a
functioning utopian society. In People of the Rainbow, Michael I. Niman offers the first comprehensive
study of this  countercultural group, also known as the Rainbow Nation or Rainbow Family. Niman's
insightful and compelling profile describes the origins and recent history of the Rainbows and explains the
eclectic philosophy of environmentalism, feminism, peace activism, group sharing, libertarianism, and
consensus government they espouse.

A fictional re-creation of a day in the life of a Rainbow character named Sunflower begins the book,
illustrating events that might typically occur at an annual North American Rainbow Gathering. Using
interviews with Rainbows, content analysis of media reports, participant observation, and scrutiny of
government documents relating to the group, Niman presents a complex picture of the Family and its
relationship to mainstream culture—called "Babylon" by the Rainbows. Niman also looks at internal
contradictions within the Family and examines members' problematic relationship with Native Americans,
whose culture and spiritual beliefs they have appropriated.

The nomadic nature of the Rainbow Family has long exasperated the U.S. government--especially the Forest
Service--and has baffled the media. Niman places the Rainbow Family's gatherings in a historical context by
framing the group's activities in terms of the long tradition of intentional communities and utopian
experimentation within the United States. Concluding with reflections on the successes and limitations of the
Rainbow movement, People of the Rainbow provides an extensive ethnography of this intriguing subculture
and provides fresh insights into the ongoing legacy of utopian communalism.

The Author: Michael I. Niman is an adjunct assistant professor of American studies at the State University of
New York at Buffalo and a lecturer in the communication department at Buffalo State College.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Milliner:

With other case, little folks like to read book People Of The Rainbow: Nomadic Utopia. You can choose the
best book if you like reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a book People Of The
Rainbow: Nomadic Utopia. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world with a book.
Absolutely right, simply because from book you can learn everything! From your country right up until
foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you may know that. In this
era, we could open a book or perhaps searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when
you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Joshua Orvis:

Typically the book People Of The Rainbow: Nomadic Utopia has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you
check out this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was authored by the very famous author.
Mcdougal makes some research just before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can
get the point easily after scanning this book.

Christina Mundell:

This People Of The Rainbow: Nomadic Utopia is great publication for you because the content that is
certainly full of information for you who also always deal with world and also have to make decision every
minute. This particular book reveal it information accurately using great manage word or we can declare no
rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only
will give you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with lovely delivering sentences.
Having People Of The Rainbow: Nomadic Utopia in your hand like having the world in your arm, facts in it
is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no guide that offer you world within ten or fifteen moment right but this
book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt that
will?

Reuben Beaubien:

Reading a book to get new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you read a book
you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, because book has a lot
of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that you have read. In
order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you want to entertain
yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and soon. The People Of The Rainbow:
Nomadic Utopia provide you with a new experience in looking at a book.
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