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A strikingly different take on world history, from the former editor-in-chief of The Guinness
Encyclopedia

Conventional chronologies of world history concentrate on the reigns of kings and queens, the dates of
battles and treaties, the publication dates of great books, the completion of famous buildings, the deaths of
iconic figures, and the years of major discoveries. But there are other more interesting stories to tell, stories
which can bring the past vividly and excitingly to life. Imagine a book that tells you the date of the ancient
Roman law that made it legal to break wind at banquets; the name of the defunct medieval pope whose
putrefying corpse was subjected to the humiliation of a trial before a court of law; the identity of the priapic
monarch who sired more bastards than any other king of England; and last but not least the date of the
demise in London of the first goat to have circumnavigated the globe—twice. Imagine a book crammed with
such deliciously disposable information, and you have History Without the Boring Bits. By turns bizarre,
surprising, trivial, and enlightening, this book offers rich pickings for the browser, and entertainment and
inspiration aplenty for those who have grown weary of more conventional works of history.
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From reader reviews:

Dale Hollander:

The book with title History without the Boring Bits: A Curious Chronology of the World posesses a lot of
information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new
knowledge the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world currently. That is
important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new era of
the internationalization. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read this anywhere
you want.

Marquita Oswald:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read a book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day every day to
reading a book. The book History without the Boring Bits: A Curious Chronology of the World it is rather
good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this
book. Should you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can
m0ore very easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book provides
high quality.

Virginia Hughes:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on
book like comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving History without the
Boring Bits: A Curious Chronology of the World that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by
means of reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the way for people to know
world better then how they react toward the world. It can't be said constantly that reading habit only for the
geeky man but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all you who want to start looking
at as your good habit, you may pick History without the Boring Bits: A Curious Chronology of the World
become your starter.

Michael Banks:

This History without the Boring Bits: A Curious Chronology of the World is new way for you who has
curiosity to look for some information as it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you into it getting
knowledge more you know or you who still having little digest in reading this History without the Boring
Bits: A Curious Chronology of the World can be the light food in your case because the information inside
this book is easy to get by anyone. These books develop itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone,
that's why I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel drowsy



even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is no in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find
actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book type for your
better life in addition to knowledge.
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