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The world is a veritable stage for superpowers. Major historical events are best viewed as the outcomes of
games played by superpowers for their own economic interests. The objective of this book is to explore the
primary cause of global historical events. A global economic disparity (GED) motivates superpowers to
pursue their interests and results in the corresponding global historical event (GHE).

This book explores the causal relationships between GEDs and GHEs that stand out in recent global history
since the first Industrial Revolution, taking a geoeconomic approach which encompasses economics,
international political affairs, history, and geography. The book confirms the causalities between GEDs and
GHEs. It is a pioneering work that provides a unique but powerful policy implication: in order to alleviate
international conflicts and tensions between superpowers, it is necessary to reduce GEDs. And since it is
virtually impossible for a few superpowers to reduce the GEDs, the world economy needs a multipolar
economic system for global stability through competition.

The book was written shortly after the world economy was trapped within downward spirals caused by the
US financial crisis and its contagion. As a collective representation of GEDs in various areas, the financial
disparity is a central part of GEDs. The book rigorously examines the financial crisis (2008-2014) in the
United States and the Fed’s response, a program of quantitative easing (QE) implemented in three phases,
while bearing in mind that the origin of the current crisis is not solely the financial sector or stock markets,
but worldwide economic disequilibrium.

This book also focuses on the details for the causal relationships prevailing in several major areas: human
resources, raw materials, energy, environment, and poverty.
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From reader reviews:

Delbert Lambert:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or even goal; it means that guide
has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they take because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who
don't like looking at a book? Sometime, man feel need book if they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you will require this Global Economic Disparity: A Dynamic Force in
Geoeconomic Competition of Superpowers.

Anna Bailey:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on
book like comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not attempting Global Economic
Disparity: A Dynamic Force in Geoeconomic Competition of Superpowers that give your entertainment
preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the
opportinity for people to know world better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be said
constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to always be
success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as your good habit, it is possible to pick Global
Economic Disparity: A Dynamic Force in Geoeconomic Competition of Superpowers become your current
starter.

Mitchell Peed:

This Global Economic Disparity: A Dynamic Force in Geoeconomic Competition of Superpowers is new
way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information because it relief your hunger details.
Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having tiny amount of digest in
reading this Global Economic Disparity: A Dynamic Force in Geoeconomic Competition of Superpowers
can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by means of
anyone. These books acquire itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the
e-book web form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the
answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It
should be here for an individual. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book variety for your better life along
with knowledge.

Bessie Starns:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It
is called of book Global Economic Disparity: A Dynamic Force in Geoeconomic Competition of



Superpowers. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it can add
your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about
reserve. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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