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"If your job requires investigating compromised Windows hosts, you must read Windows Forensic
Analysis." -Richard Bejtlich, Coauthor of Real Digital Forensics and Amazon.com Top 500 Book Reviewer

"The Registry Analysis chapter alone is worth the price of the book." -Troy Larson, Senior Forensic
Investigator of Microsoft's IT Security Group "I also found that the entire book could have been written on
just registry forensics. However, in order to create broad appeal, the registry section was probably shortened.
You can tell Harlan has a lot more to tell." -Rob Lee, Instructor and Fellow at the SANS Technology
Institute, coauthor of Know Your Enemy: Learning About Security Threats, 2E

Author Harlan Carvey has brought his best-selling book up-to-date to give you: the responder, examiner, or
analyst the must-have tool kit for your job. Windows is the largest operating system on desktops and servers
worldwide, which mean more intrusions, malware infections, and cybercrime happen on these systems.
Windows Forensic Analysis DVD Toolkit, 2E covers both live and post-mortem response collection and
analysis methodologies, addressing material that is applicable to law enforcement, the federal government,
students, and consultants. The book is also accessible to system administrators, who are often the frontline
when an incident occurs, but due to staffing and budget constraints do not have the necessary knowledge to
respond effectively. The book's companion DVD contains significant new and updated materials (movies,
spreadsheet, code, etc.) not available any place else, because they are created and maintained by the author.

Best-Selling Windows Digital Forensic book completely updated in this 2nd Edition●

Learn how to Analyze Data During Live and Post-Mortem Investigations●

DVD Includes Custom Tools, Updated Code, Movies, and Spreadsheets!●

Note: The Kindle edition of this book does not include any CDs or DVDs.
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From reader reviews:

Danny Exum:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you learn a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The
Windows Forensic Analysis DVD Toolkit provide you with a new experience in studying a book.

Pauline Stern:

You are able to spend your free time to read this book this e-book. This Windows Forensic Analysis DVD
Toolkit is simple to create you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not
get much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you easier to read it.
You can save typically the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when one buys this book.

Tyron Lenahan:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Windows Forensic Analysis DVD Toolkit can be the
solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your extra time by reading
in this completely new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Jason Braden:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by internet on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is known as of
book Windows Forensic Analysis DVD Toolkit. You can include your knowledge by it. Without departing
the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you
must aware about book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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