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The enigmatic and powerful Tlacaelel (1398–1487), wrote annalist Chimalpahin, was “the beginning and
origin” of the Mexica monarchy in fifteenth-century Mesoamerica. Brother of the first Moteuczoma,
Tlacaelel would become “the most powerful, feared, and esteemed man of all that the world had seen up to
that time.” But this outsize figure of Aztec history has also long been shrouded in mystery. In Tlacaelel
Remembered, the first biography of the Mexica nobleman, Susan Schroeder searches out the truth about his
life and legacy.

A century after Tlacaelel’s death, in the wake of the conquistadors, Spaniards and natives recorded the
customs, histories, and language of the Nahua, or Aztec, people. Three of these chroniclers—fray Diego
Durán, don Hernando Alvarado Tezozomoc, and especially don Domingo de San Antón Muñón Chimalpahin
Quauhtlehuanitzin—wrote of Tlacaelel. But the inaccessibility of Chimalpahin’s annals has meant that for
centuries of Aztec history, Tlacaelel has appeared, if at all, as a myth.

Working from Chimalpahin’s newly available writings and exploring connections and variances in other
source materials, Schroeder draws the clearest possible portrait of Tlacaelel, revealing him as the architect of
the Aztec empire’s political power and its military might—a politician on par with Machiavelli. As the
advisor to five Mexica rulers, Tlacaelel shaped the organization of the Mexica state and broadened the reach
of its empire—feats typically accomplished with the spread of warfare, human sacrifice, and cannibalism. In
the annals, he is considered the “second king” to the rulers who built the empire, and is given the title
“Cihuacoatl,” used for the office of president and judge.

As Schroeder traces Tlacaelel through the annals, she also examines how his story was transmitted and
transformed in later histories. The resulting work is the most complete and comprehensive account ever
given of this significant figure in Mesoamerican history.
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From reader reviews:

Darius Cramer:

The ability that you get from Tlacaelel Remembered: Mastermind of the Aztec Empire (The Civilization of
the American Indian Series) may be the more deep you excavating the information that hide within the words
the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Tlacaelel
Remembered: Mastermind of the Aztec Empire (The Civilization of the American Indian Series) giving you
enjoyment feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood
by simply anyone who read that because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This specific
book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go along with
you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this particular Tlacaelel
Remembered: Mastermind of the Aztec Empire (The Civilization of the American Indian Series) instantly.

Maria Casillas:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Tlacaelel Remembered: Mastermind of the Aztec Empire
(The Civilization of the American Indian Series) as your daily resource information.

Gary Wilson:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will see
that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to your
account is Tlacaelel Remembered: Mastermind of the Aztec Empire (The Civilization of the American
Indian Series) this book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This particular
book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use for explain
it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some research when he makes this book. That is why this
book acceptable all of you.

Joan Stump:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled
update of news. In this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an
individual. From media social just like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book,



novel and comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open
your book? Or just in search of the Tlacaelel Remembered: Mastermind of the Aztec Empire (The
Civilization of the American Indian Series) when you required it?
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