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    A limited signed first edition of the testimony and learning of negligent driving leading to road rage that
can be overcome through awareness and faith, covered in nine chapters and seven supplements. Written
mostly from a biographical viewpoint of a negligent driver who confessed and testified of undesirable
driving situations that led to a subsequent, deep self-evaluation and reform. Includes second- and third-
person narratives that discuss various general automobile topics. Referenced and illustrated. This book can
be read as a tutorial or be used as a quick-reference guide to physiological and psychological causes of all
kinds of bad driving. The underlying theme is that of the inescapable influences of both good and evil
spiritual forces, while remaining non-prejudicial and non-condescending.

Sometimes, there is more to driving than just meets the eye. Never before has a formerly negligent and
reckless driver come forth with valid testimony about the negative, hellish feelings and consequences of
driving like a maniac. Mr. McGinley gives credible explanations as to the dangers of risky driving and the
benefits of hypocrisy awareness, and how such an awareness is also an integral part of the Christian faith.
Not preachy, not a sunshine lecture, just the straight facts from an ordinary citizen sharing how his
previously undesirable actions behind the wheel caused more anguish than was thought possible. No other
book about driving covers important topics as they are related to driving and Christian principles in such
relevant detail. Sometimes, it's what is not seen that matters the most.

This is M. D. McGinley's first published book and a Limited Signed First Edition. The print run was limited
to only 200 copies. No other editions of this title exist, making it very rare and a true collectible. Each copy
was signed in diminishing rarity as follows: black ink, approximately 120 copies (exact number of black
signatures unknown); blue ink, approximately 47 copies (exact number of blue signatures unknown); red ink,
22 copies; green ink, 10 copies, and 1 copy of 200 signed by the author in purple ink, making the latter an
ultra rare find, with only one copy in existence. What is more, Confessions of a Reformed Road Warrior was
printed by a printer who no longer manufactures perfect-bound books, adding even more value to your
collection while at the same time offering the most effective, no-fluff and straight-forward testimony known
about the negative consequences of bad driving. Acquire each of M. D. McGinley's Limited Signed First
Editions, and don't stop until you get all three of his automotive books signed in purple ink. This is
something not known to have been offered before by any author in history: a truly extraordinary opportunity
to acquire an author's first, second and third limited signed first editions in one collection, with only one
copy of each in existence signed in purple ink. Even if you manage to acquire the very rare green or red
signatures, the search is just as much fun as the catch!
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From reader reviews:

Nora Carter:

The experience that you get from Confessions of a Reformed Road Warrior may be the more deep you
looking the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that
this book is hard to understand but Confessions of a Reformed Road Warrior giving you thrill feeling of
reading. The article author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by simply anyone who
read that because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your
vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or
e-book style are available. We propose you for having this particular Confessions of a Reformed Road
Warrior instantly.

Phillip Barker:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic in the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to
something different to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book is usually option to fill
your totally free time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should
read. If you want to attempt look for book, may be the publication untitled Confessions of a Reformed Road
Warrior can be very good book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Larry Artz:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for your requirements is Confessions of a Reformed Road Warrior this guide consist a lot of
the information with the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented so why is the
world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand.
Typically the writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.

Kenneth Copeland:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that query was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you know that
little person including reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to something by
book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this
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