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This is the nineteenth global report on tuberculosis (TB) published by WHO in a series that started in 1997.
It provides a comprehensive and up-to-date assessment of the TB epidemic and progress in implementing
and financing TB prevention, care and control at global, regional and country levels using data reported by
over 200 countries that account for over 99% of the world's TB cases. The report is accompanied by a special
supplement that marks the 20th anniversary of the establishment of the Global Project on Anti-TB Drug
Resistance Surveillance. The supplement highlights the latest status of knowledge about the epidemic of
multidrug-resistant TB (MDR-TB) and the programmatic response.

The report has 9 main chapters. The introductory chapter provides general background on TB as well as an
explanation of current global targets for TB control, the WHO's Stop TB Strategy that covers the period
2006-2015 and the post-2015 global TB strategy that was recently endorsed by all Member States at the 2014
World Health Assembly. The remaining eight chapters cover the disease burden caused by TB (incidence,
prevalence, mortality); a special assessment (countdown to 2015) of progress towards 2015 global TB targets
at global, regional and country level; TB case notifications and treatment outcomes; drug resistance
surveillance among TB patients and the programmatic response in detecting and providing treatment for
multidrug-resistant TB; diagnostics and laboratory strengthening for TB; addressing the co-epidemics of TB
and HIV; financing TB care and control; and research and development for new TB diagnostics, drugs and
vaccines.

The three annexes of the report include an explanation of how to access and use the online global TB
database, one-page profiles for 22 high TB-burden countries and one page regional profiles for WHO's six
regions.
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From reader reviews:

Gina Gregg:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the book entitled Global Tuberculosis Report. Try to make the book Global
Tuberculosis Report as your close friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you really feel alone
and beside those of course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book
makes you far more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , let us make new
experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Jeremy Hutchings:

The event that you get from Global Tuberculosis Report will be the more deep you excavating the
information that hide inside words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is
hard to know but Global Tuberculosis Report giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The copy writer
conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood simply by anyone who read that because the
author of this e-book is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your personal vocabulary
increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
advise you for having that Global Tuberculosis Report instantly.

Jean Mora:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the
best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book Global
Tuberculosis Report. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could
possibly add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most important that, you must
aware about book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.

Elizabeth Rivera:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen have to have book to know the update information of year to be able to year. As we know
those ebooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. With the book Global Tuberculosis Report we can take more advantage. Don't you to be creative
people? To become creative person must love to read a book. Simply choose the best book that acceptable
with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with this book Global Tuberculosis Report. You
can more pleasing than now.
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