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All the beauty of coloring with chalk but without the mess! These 32 hand-drawn Christmas designs feature
all of the charming imperfections of original chalkboard art. Relax and fill them with color to create your
own rustic-chic masterpiece. From wreaths, mistletoe, and snowflakes to eggnog and hot cocoa, these happy
holiday images evoke fond memories of sweet celebrations. Each festive white line illustration is presented
on a textured black background, just like a real chalkboard. You'll be delighted by the way warm colors,
bright colors, neons, and lighter pastel shades really pop from these designs. Use light-colored pencils and
gel pens to personalize your work with lettering, flourishes, and patterning. Talented chalkboard artist
Valerie McKeehan provides useful coloring tips and tricks, along with beautifully colored examples to help
get you inspired. Printed on one side only of high-quality, extra-thick paper, each perforated page detaches
easily for gifting or display.
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From reader reviews:

Alejandro Koenig:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They
are really reading whatever they take because their hobby will be reading a book. Why not the person who
don't like looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book after they found difficult problem as well as
exercise. Well, probably you should have this Chalk-Style Holiday Coloring Book: Color with All Types of
Markers, Gel Pens & Colored Pencils.

Mary Russell:

Reading a book tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with their story or
even their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the data about
something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your sons or daughters,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their expertise
in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to their book. One of them is this Chalk-Style
Holiday Coloring Book: Color with All Types of Markers, Gel Pens & Colored Pencils.

Wendy Lambert:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you
need to do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. Among
the books in the top listing in your reading list is Chalk-Style Holiday Coloring Book: Color with All Types
of Markers, Gel Pens & Colored Pencils. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get
you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking right up and review this reserve you can get many
advantages.

Penny Risley:

Some individuals said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose typically the book Chalk-Style Holiday Coloring Book:
Color with All Types of Markers, Gel Pens & Colored Pencils to make your personal reading is interesting.
Your skill of reading skill is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book to make
you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book and looking at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for
you to like to start a book and examine it. Beside that the reserve Chalk-Style Holiday Coloring Book: Color
with All Types of Markers, Gel Pens & Colored Pencils can to be a newly purchased friend when you're feel



alone and confuse using what must you're doing of their time.
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