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Spending millions of dollars to renovate, reconfigure, expand, or replace a facility can be intimidating
without the right direction. Healthcare Facility Planning: Thinking Strategically, Second Edition, is a
practical guide that will help healthcare executives move confidently from planning to implementation by
deploying an integrated facility planning process, understanding the trends that affect space utilization and
configuration, and planning flexible facilities. The book's focus is on predesign planning a stage of the
healthcare facility planning, design, and construction process that is frequently overlooked as organizations
eagerly jump from strategic planning into the more glamorous phase of design. Healthcare executives have
the greatest opportunity to express a vision for their organization s future during predesign planning, and
decisions made during this stage have the greatest impact on long term operational costs and future
flexibility. Careful predesign planning allows an organization to rethink its current patient care delivery
model, operational systems and processes, and use of technology to ensure a facility substantially benefits
patients, caregivers, and payers. This new edition addresses current issues new financial incentives,
fluctuating utilization and demand, constant pressure for technology adoption and deployment, rising turf
wars among specialists, intense focus on patient safety, and aging physical plants that affect the way
facilities are used, planned, financed, and built. Detailed examples, guidelines, and case studies, many new to
this edition, lead the reader step-by-step through the facility planning process. This book s planning process
reveals how a new facility can improve operational efficiency, enhance customer satisfaction, and create new
revenue streams, in addition to being aesthetically pleasing and well engineered. Highlights include:
Deploying an integrated facility planning process tailored to an institution s unique needs; Understanding the
trends that affect space allocation and configuration; Defining strategic direction and future demand;
Coordinating operations improvement initiatives and planned technology investments with facility planning
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From reader reviews:

Rose Villegas:

The feeling that you get from Healthcare Facility Planning: Thinking Strategically (ACHE Management)
could be the more deep you searching the information that hide in the words the more you get considering
reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Healthcare Facility Planning: Thinking
Strategically (ACHE Management) giving you thrill feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in
certain way that can be understood simply by anyone who read that because the author of this book is well-
known enough. This book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand
then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this kind of
Healthcare Facility Planning: Thinking Strategically (ACHE Management) instantly.

Timothy Holeman:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the headline Healthcare
Facility Planning: Thinking Strategically (ACHE Management) suitable to you? Often the book was written
by renowned writer in this era. Often the book untitled Healthcare Facility Planning: Thinking Strategically
(ACHE Management)is the main of several books that will everyone read now. That book was inspired many
people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new age that you ever know previous to.
The author explained their plan in the simple way, so all of people can easily to understand the core of this e-
book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you to see the
represented of the world with this book.

Irene Wang:

The book Healthcare Facility Planning: Thinking Strategically (ACHE Management) has a lot of knowledge
on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous
author. Tom makes some research just before write this book. That book very easy to read you can find the
point easily after reading this article book.

Claudia Butler:

This Healthcare Facility Planning: Thinking Strategically (ACHE Management) is great reserve for you
because the content that is full of information for you who all always deal with world and get to make
decision every minute. This specific book reveal it info accurately using great coordinate word or we can
state no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't
mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but difficult core information with attractive delivering
sentences. Having Healthcare Facility Planning: Thinking Strategically (ACHE Management) in your hand
like obtaining the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no e-book that offer you
world with ten or fifteen minute right but this guide already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hi Mr.
and Mrs. busy do you still doubt in which?
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