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A diaristic exploration of procrastination, pregnancy, and art

The day before Cyrus Console and his pregnant wife leave for a monthlong visit to Romania, they receive
troubling news?the fetus she’s carrying is at elevated risk for Down syndrome. As the trip unfolds, his worry
spirals into broader meditations on parenthood, language, addiction, love, marriage, and the passage and
management of time. In and among the cities of Roman, Iasi, and Bucharest, Console chronicles his loving
but comically awkward interactions with friends and family, taking place as they do in a language and
culture unfamiliar to him.

The resulting travel diary moves beyond daily life to delve into the enigmas of art, suffering, creativity, and
family. Mixing memory with acute observations on everything from chess and stray dogs to heartbreak and
dreamscape, Romanian Notebook turns the anxiety and rumination of the expectant parent into a deeper way
of thinking about the human condition.
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From reader reviews:

Shannon Batiste:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Romanian Notebook. All
type of book could you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Susan Metcalf:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of e-book you read, if
you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Romanian Notebook is kind of
e-book which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

John Mallery:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The
particular book that recommended to you personally is Romanian Notebook this publication consist a lot of
the information of the condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown
up. The dialect styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some study
when he makes this book. That is why this book acceptable all of you.

Richard Cary:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every
year has been exactly added. This book Romanian Notebook was filled in relation to science. Spend your
free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has diverse feel when
they reading any book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can experience enjoy to read a
reserve. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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