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High fantasy, contemporary and urban fantasy, fantasy action and adventure all set in a military vein by top
authors including Jonathan Maberry, Tobias Buckell, Elizabeth Moon, Tanya Huff, Glen Cook, Simon R.
Green, Seanan McGuire, and Linda Nagata.

In the realms of fantasy, the battlefield is where heroism comes alive, magic is unleashed, and legends are
made and unmade. From the War of the Ring, Tolkien’s epic battle of good versus evil, to The Battle of the
Blackwater, George R.R. Martin’s grim portrait of the horror and futility of war, these fantastical conflicts
reflect our highest hopes and darkest fears, bringing us mesmerizing visions of silver spears shining in the
sun and vast hordes of savage beasts who threaten to destroy all that we hold dear. Now, acclaimed editor
John Joseph Adams is sounding the battle cry and sixteen of today’s top authors are reporting for duty,
spinning never-before-published, spellbinding tales of military fantasy, including a Black Company story
from Glen Cook, a Paksenarrion story from Elizabeth Moon, and a Shadow Ops story by Myke Cole. Within
these pages you’ll also find World War I trenches cloaked in poison gas and sorcery, modern day elite
special forces battling hosts of the damned, and steampunk soldiers fighting for their lives in a world torn
apart by powers that defy imagination. Featuring both grizzled veterans and fresh young recruits alike,
including Tanya Huff, Simon R. Green, Carrie Vaughn, Jonathan Maberry, and Seanan McGuire, Operation
Arcana is a must for any military buff or fantasy fan. You’ll never look at war the same way again.

CONTRIBUTORS:
Elizabeth Moon
Tobias Buckell & David Klecha
Myke Cole
Jonathan Maberry
Genevieve Valentine
Django Wexler
Yoon Ha Lee
Weston Ochse
Myke Cole
Ari Marmell
Tanya Huff
Carrie Vaughn
TC McCarthy
Glen Cook
Simon R. Green
Seanan McGuire
Linda Nagata

About John Joseph Adams:
“John Joseph Adams has become one of those editors who I know will put together something I will love to
read and know that the book I’m about to purchase isn’t going to let me down.” —Wil Wheaton

“Merits a place on fantasy fans’ bookshelves.” —Publishers Weekly, on Epic: Legends of Fantasy

“A genuine triumph . . . [A] ‘must buy’ for every sci-fan you know.” —Romantic Times, a “Top Pick” for



February 2013, on The Mad Scientist’s Guide to World Domination
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From reader reviews:

Marie Gambino:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Operation Arcana (Baen) will make you to be
smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think that
open or reading the book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have
you looking for best book or ideal book with you?

Richard Twombly:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in
e-book way, more simple and reachable. That Operation Arcana (Baen) can give you a lot of good friends
because by you checking out this one book you have point that they don't and make anyone more like an
interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you
information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than different make you to be great
folks. So , why hesitate? Let's have Operation Arcana (Baen).

Jacob King:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but additionally novel and Operation Arcana (Baen) as well as others sources
were given information for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel wish to read more
and more. Science publication was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those guides are
helping them to put their knowledge. In other case, beside science publication, any other book likes
Operation Arcana (Baen) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.

Ruth Little:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the up-date information of year to year. As we know
those textbooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. Through the book Operation Arcana (Baen) we can consider more advantage. Don't someone to be
creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that
suited with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with that book Operation Arcana (Baen). You
can more inviting than now.
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