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Greg Burham, a Navy SEAL Vietnam combat veteran came home to an ungrateful nation. Carrying the
invisible wounds of Post Traumatic Stress Disorder before the medical profession understood the condition,
Greg struggled to take the next steps in his life.

One Step at a Time is the story of Greg Burham's journey, tracing his walk of discovery and healing almost
4,000 miles from Alaska to Mexico. With every step, he grew stronger in his faith in God, in himself and in
others, eventually finding his place in the world helping people deal with trauma, from troubled teens, to
combat veterans, to 9/11 first responders.

Greg was born into a family that venerated service, encouraged him to always give his best, and taught him
to give selflessly. The son of a World War II veteran, Greg was a hometown sports hero who patriotically
enlisted in the US Navy. After earning his Trident and becoming a Navy SEAL, he was deployed to Vietnam
for a harrowing tour, often behind enemy lines.

After serving as one of the feared "Men with Green Faces" in Vietnam, Greg returned to a world where
veterans were considered evil or crazy. Facing the scorn of his peers, he struggled with PTSD and missed the
goal-driven, physically challenging world of the Navy SEAL community. Seeking answers, a challenge and
renewal, Greg embarked on this journey.

This epic hike put Greg on a path to his life's work, helping people deal with PTSD-including veterans of the
North Vietnamese Army. His work has played a role in removing the stigma that has prevented SEALs from
getting help in the past and that is putting an end to the emotional pain our nation's hero veterans too often
suffer.
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From reader reviews:

Lawrence Weatherby:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great and important the book One Step at a Time: A Navy Seal
Vietnam Combat Veteran's Journey Home. All type of book are you able to see on many options. You can
look for the internet methods or other social media.

Larry Brackett:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a publication you will get new information due to the fact book is one of many ways
to share the information as well as their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring you to
definitely imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to
others. When you read this One Step at a Time: A Navy Seal Vietnam Combat Veteran's Journey Home, you
could tells your family, friends and also soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the
mediocre, make them reading a publication.

Paul Kindig:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like One Step at a Time: A Navy Seal
Vietnam Combat Veteran's Journey Home which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
view.

Teresa Burns:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real
their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this One Step at a Time: A Navy Seal Vietnam Combat Veteran's Journey
Home can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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