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In Volume 4 of The Papers of Jefferson Davis, which covers the years 1849 to 1852, Davis had clearly
chosen politics ar his life's work. He relished in his role as Mississippi's senior senator and willingly assumed
the responsibility of being a national spokesman for the South. This period also saw a number of events in
Davis' personal life, notably the birth of his first child and the beginning of a long estrangement from his
brother Joseph.

In January, 1849, Davis signed the Southern Address, although he occasionally disagreed with the extreme
positions of its author, John C. Calhoun. Outside the Senate, Davis supported the objectives of the Nashville
Convention and, later, the idea of a southern congress. During the crisis of 1850 Davis spoke often on such
key issues as the regulation of slavery in the territories, the extension of the Missouri Compromise line, the
admission of California, the Texas-New Mexico boundary, the continuation of the slave trade in the District
of Columbia, and the Fugitive Slave Act. In 1851 he proposed purchasing camels for military transportation
and urged that a Pacific railroad route be considered in the definition of the Mexican boundary.

As a loyal Democrat, Davis had supported Lewis Cass in 1848, but he was a conspicuous personal favorite
of Zachary Taylor, the new Whig president and his former father-in-law. In 1850 Taylor reportedly
intervened to prevent a duel between Illinois representative William H. Bissell and Davis, who was incensed
by Bissell's remarks about the Mississippi regiment at Buena Vista. Soon after joining the Taylor family at
the president's deathbed in July, 1850, Davis defended Taylor's Mexican War performance in well-publicized
Senate speech. Between sessions in 1849 Davis canvassed Mississippi, addressing gatherings throughout the
state in favor of congressional candidates. He warned of northern aggressions, yet urged the exhaustion of all
means of peaceful resistance before secession be considered. When he returned home after the arduous 1850
session, he defended his course, denying charges that he was a disunionist.

In February, 1850, Davis had been reelected to the Senate for a full six-year term, but in September, 1851, he
resigned to accept the Sate Rights nomination for governor in opposition to Union nominee Henry Foote.
Although illness precluded much active campaigning in the few weeks before the election, Davis
substantially reduced the Union lead and lost by a narrow margin. A private citizen for the first time since
1845, Davis continued his involvement in politics. Despite nagging personal problems and ill health, he
promoted Democratic unity and took to the stump for Franklin Pierce in 1852.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Thompson:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They can
be reading whatever they get because their hobby is usually reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you should have this The Papers of Jefferson Davis: 1849--1852.

Ralph Dell:

What do you concerning book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy person? If you
don't have spare time to perform others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have extra time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They have to answer that
question due to the fact just their can do that will. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each
person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this particular The Papers
of Jefferson Davis: 1849--1852 to read.

Wilbert York:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now is
taking seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you
receive the unstable resource then you understand it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage
for you. All those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take The Papers of Jefferson Davis:
1849--1852 as your daily resource information.

Ruth Vazquez:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This book The Papers of Jefferson Davis: 1849--1852 was
colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book The Papers of Jefferson Davis:
1849--1852 has many kinds or type. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigation
company Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are usually
make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs
and try to like reading that will.
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