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Too many laws, too many lawyers--that's the necessary consequence of a complex society, or so
conventional wisdom has it. Countless pundits insist that any call for legal simplification smacks of
nostalgia, sentimentality, or naiveté. But the conventional view, the noted legal scholar Richard Epstein tells
us, has it exactly backward. The richer texture of modern society allows for more individual freedom and
choice. And it allows us to organize a comprehensive legal order capable of meeting the technological and
social challenges of today on the basis of just six core principles. In this book, Epstein demonstrates how.

The first four rules, which regulate human interactions in ordinary social life, concern the autonomy of the
individual, property, contract, and tort. Taken together these rules establish and protect consistent
entitlements over all resources, both human and natural. These rules are backstopped by two more rules that
permit forced exchanges on payment of just compensation when private or public necessity so dictates.
Epstein then uses these six building blocks to clarify many intractable problems in the modern legal
landscape. His discussion of employment contracts explains the hidden virtues of contracts at will and
exposes the crippling weaknesses of laws regarding collective bargaining, unjust dismissal, employer
discrimination, and comparable worth. And his analysis shows how laws governing liability for products and
professional services, corporate transactions, and environmental protection have generated unnecessary
social strife and economic dislocation by violating these basic principles.

Simple Rules for a Complex World offers a sophisticated agenda for comprehensive social reform that
undoes much of the mischief of the modern regulatory state. At a time when most Americans have come to
distrust and fear government at all levels, Epstein shows how a consistent application of economic and
political theory allows us to steer a middle path between too much and too little.
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From reader reviews:

Toni Bays:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will probably
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to
anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Simple Rules for a Complex World is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in
this era.

Vincent Erickson:

The ability that you get from Simple Rules for a Complex World is a more deep you searching the
information that hide into the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this
book is hard to be aware of but Simple Rules for a Complex World giving you joy feeling of reading. The
author conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood by simply anyone who read that
because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. That book also makes your personal vocabulary
increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We suggest you for having this specific Simple Rules for a Complex World instantly.

James Sweeney:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right you can have
the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Simple Rules for a Complex World
which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Stella Neal:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got pupils? We believe that that question was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know that
little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know that reading is very
important and also book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
current teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update about something by book. Many kinds of books
that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually Simple Rules for a Complex World.
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