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Lianna is an aspiring planetary scientist…and also a kissing addict.  This summer, though, she plans to spend
every kiss-worthy hour in the lab, studying stars.  

Hank has never been kissed.  He’s smart and funny and very socially awkward, because he's got Asperger’s
syndrome. Hank's plan for the summer is to work at a music store and save enough to buy his beloved
Fender Jazzmaster.   
 
What neither Liana nor Hank plan for is their fateful meeting...in the women's bathroom at the hospital. But
their star-crossed encounter could be the very best kind.

 Two veteran YA authors tell, from alternating perspecitives, the story of two kids who discover that the best
parts of people can't be summed up easily. 
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From reader reviews:

Tammi Kendrick:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the concept The Half-
Life of Planets suitable to you? Typically the book was written by popular writer in this era. The book
untitled The Half-Life of Planetsis the main one of several books which everyone read now. This book was
inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new age that you ever
know before. The author explained their thought in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to
recognise the core of this book. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So that
you can see the represented of the world with this book.

William Fuller:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you are related
is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of the books in the
top collection in your reading list will be The Half-Life of Planets. This book and that is qualified as The
Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking upwards and review this reserve
you can get many advantages.

Harry Alvey:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This reserve The Half-Life of Planets was filled concerning science. Spend your time to add
your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has several feel when they
reading the book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a reserve. In the
modern era like now, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Philip Nguyen:

Publication is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen want book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. Through the
book The Half-Life of Planets we can acquire more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? Being
creative person must prefer to read a book. Only choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end
up being doubt to change your life at this time book The Half-Life of Planets. You can more appealing than
now.
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