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How can you grow and maintain a reliable, flexible, and cost-efficient network in the face of ever-increasing
demands? With this practical guide, network engineers will learn how to program Juniper network devices to
perform day-to-day tasks, using the automation features of the Junos OS.

Junos supports several automation tools that provide powerful solutions to common network automation
tasks. Authors Jonathan Looney and Stacy Smith, senior testing engineers at Juniper, will help you determine
which tools work best for your particular network requirements. If you have experience with Junos, this book
will show you how automation can make a big difference in the operation of your existing network.

Manage Junos software with remote procedure calls and a RESTful API●

Represent devices as Python objects and manage them with Python’s PyEZ package●

Customize Junos software to detect and block commits that violate your network standards●

Develop custom CLI commands to present information the way you want●

Program Junos software to automatically respond to network events●

Rapidly deploy new Junos devices into your network with ZTP and Netconify tools●

Learn how to use Ansible or Puppet to manage Junos software●
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From reader reviews:

Caroline Petrie:

This Automating Junos Administration: Doing More with Less book is just not ordinary book, you have it
then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book will be information inside this
publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of
information you will get. That Automating Junos Administration: Doing More with Less without we
comprehend teach the one who looking at it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't always be
worry Automating Junos Administration: Doing More with Less can bring if you are and not make your bag
space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even mobile phone. This
Automating Junos Administration: Doing More with Less having great arrangement in word along with
layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Brian Alexander:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject Automating Junos
Administration: Doing More with Less suitable to you? The book was written by famous writer in this era.
Often the book untitled Automating Junos Administration: Doing More with Lessis the main of several
books in which everyone read now. That book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read
this publication you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know just before. The author explained their
concept in the simple way, so all of people can easily to know the core of this publication. This book will
give you a large amount of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world
within this book.

Lauren Clarke:

The reason why? Because this Automating Junos Administration: Doing More with Less is an unordinary
book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will shock you with the secret
this inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who write the book in such incredible way
makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning entirely.
So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This unique book will
give you a lot of gains than the other book get such as help improving your expertise and your critical
thinking way. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were being you I will go to the book store
hurriedly.

Dorothy Saunders:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not attempting Automating Junos
Administration: Doing More with Less that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied through
reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world far



better then how they react towards the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading habit only for the
geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you who want
to start reading through as your good habit, it is possible to pick Automating Junos Administration: Doing
More with Less become your personal starter.
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