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In Spirits Rejoice! Jason Bivins explores the relationship between American religion and American music,
and the places where religion and jazz have overlapped.

Much writing about jazz tends toward glorified discographies or impressionistic descriptions of the actual
sounds. Rather than providing a history, or series of biographical entries, Spirits Rejoice! takes to heart a
central characteristic of jazz itself and improvises, generating a collection of themes, pursuits, reoccurring
foci, and interpretations. Bivins riffs on interviews, liner notes, journals, audience reception, and critical
commentary, producing a work that argues for the centrality of religious experiences to any legitimate
understanding of jazz, while also suggesting that jazz opens up new interpretations of American religious
history. Bivins examines themes such as musical creativity as related to specific religious traditions, jazz as a
form of ritual and healing, and jazz cosmologies and metaphysics. Spirits Rejoice! connects Religious
Studies to Jazz Studies through thematic portraits, and a vast number of interviews to propose a new,
improvisationally fluid archive for thinking about religion, race, and sound in the United States. Bivins's
conclusions explore how the sound of spirits rejoicing challenges not only prevailing understandings of race
and music, but also the way we think about religion.

Spirits Rejoice! is an essential volume for any student of jazz, American religion, or American culture.
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From reader reviews:

Juanita Jones:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading routine
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside
the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want sense happy read one
with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The particular Spirits Rejoice!: Jazz and American
Religion is kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Thomas Garcia:

The book Spirits Rejoice!: Jazz and American Religion will bring you to definitely the new experience of
reading a new book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book
to learn, this book very appropriate to you. The book Spirits Rejoice!: Jazz and American Religion is much
recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can
quickly to read the book.

James Drennan:

The guide with title Spirits Rejoice!: Jazz and American Religion posesses a lot of information that you can
study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This kind of book exist new know-how the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to
yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you throughout new era of
the globalization. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you
want.

Lourdes Tyner:

Reading a book for being new life style in this yr; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a book
you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, due to the fact book
has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. If you want to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you act
like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along
with soon. The Spirits Rejoice!: Jazz and American Religion offer you a new experience in studying a book.
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