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This book is structured as a step-by-step course of study along the lines of a VLSI integrated circuit design
project. The entire Verilog language is presented, from the basics to everything necessary for synthesis of an
entire 70,000 transistor, full-duplex serializer-deserializer, including synthesizable PLLs. The author
includes everything an engineer needs for in-depth understanding of the Verilog language: Syntax, synthesis
semantics, simulation and test. Complete solutions for the 27 labs are provided in the downloadable files that
accompany the book. For readers with access to appropriate electronic design tools, all solutions can be
developed, simulated, and synthesized as described in the book. A partial list of design topics includes design
partitioning, hierarchy decomposition, safe coding styles, back annotation, wrapper modules, concurrency,
race conditions, assertion-based verification, clock synchronization, and design for test. A concluding
presentation of special topics includes System Verilog and Verilog-AMS.
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From reader reviews:

David Butler:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or that for all people in the world,
the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Digital VLSI Design
with Verilog: A Textbook from Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute. All type of book can you see on many
sources. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Stacy Vincent:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book particularly
book entitled Digital VLSI Design with Verilog: A Textbook from Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute your
brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe unknown for but surely
will become your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a book then become one type
conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get before. The Digital VLSI Design with Verilog: A
Textbook from Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute giving you another experience more than blown away the
mind but also giving you useful data for your better life within this era. So now let us show you the relaxing
pattern at this point is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like
winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Robert Wilkes:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Digital VLSI Design with
Verilog: A Textbook from Silicon Valley Polytechnic Institute can be the response, oh how comes? A book
you know. You are and so out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this fresh era is common not a
geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Marjorie Calhoun:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you need to do is
just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among the books in
the top checklist in your reading list is actually Digital VLSI Design with Verilog: A Textbook from Silicon
Valley Polytechnic Institute. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning
out to be precious person. By looking right up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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