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In 1978 the Reverend Billy Graham himself consecrated Las Vegas's place in the American cultural
mainstream by taking his "crusade for Christ" there. He found the resort "a nice place to visit," and pointed
out that, while he did not gamble himself, the Bible said nothing definitive against the practice.

This book is a social history of American gambling in a series of frontier settings ranging from seventeenth-
century Jamestown to twentieth-century Nevada. The book points out the affinity between gambling and
frontiers, showing how both thrived on high expectations, risk-taking, opportunism and movement, and both
helped to shape a distinctive culture.

The first half of the book paints a vivid picture of gambling in the colonial and early national frontiers, on the
Missiissippi River, and in the California Gold Rush. Findlay describes how in the ninteenth century
progessional gamblers, operating in towns and riverboats along the Mississippi, popularized casino games,
and then tells how these gaming practices were transported to the mining frontiers of the Far West. The
second half of the book traces Las Vegas' rise as America's ultimate resort. The culmination of almost four
centuries of westward migration and chance-taking by Americans, Las Vegas represents a link between
America's frontier past and the contemporary values of the Sunbelt culture.

About the Author:

John J. Findlay is Assistant Professor of United States History at the Pennsylvania State University.
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From reader reviews:

George Seal:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book and
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new info. When
you read a book you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share the information
or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more imaginative. When you examining a
book especially fiction book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the personas do it anything.
Third, you can share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this People of Chance: Gambling in
American Society from Jamestown to Las Vegas, you can tells your family, friends and soon about yours
book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a reserve.

Lola Hernandez:

Precisely why? Because this People of Chance: Gambling in American Society from Jamestown to Las
Vegas is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap that but latter it will jolt you
with the secret the item inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who all write the book in
such remarkable way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the
meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to
regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book include such as help
improving your skill and your critical thinking method. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I had
been you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Jacqueline Kellett:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to study a book. When you go through a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition to
soon. The People of Chance: Gambling in American Society from Jamestown to Las Vegas provide you with
a new experience in looking at a book.

Jessie Davis:

You can get this People of Chance: Gambling in American Society from Jamestown to Las Vegas by visit
the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve challenge if you get
difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by simply written or printed
but in addition can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking
by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more
information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are



still revise. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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