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For many years now, there has been a strong economic scholarship pointing to the importance of institutions
in general - and, more particularly, legal rules and the rule of law - for economic development. The
importance of law for economic growth has also been empirically tested in many well-known and often cited
studies. These studies seem to indicate not only that law is relevant in the development of countries and their
economic growth in particular, but more specifically, that particular legal systems do better than others. The
tenant of this scholarship (especially initiated by Andrej Schleifer and others) is that the common law would
be a more efficient system in promoting economic growth than the civil law. However, many scholars doubt
the empirical claim of this and criticize these findings, both on methodological grounds as well as on
grounds of a misconception of differences between the civil and the common law. The interest in legal
origins for the efficiency of the legal system also focuses on particular legal regimes, such as accident law,
environmental law, or corporate law. Increasingly, the question is also asked whether legal institutions and
the rule of law are also important in the process whereby poor nations develop their economy. For example,
Cooter, Schafer, and Ulen have attempted to examine why particular developing countries do relatively
better than others and, roughly speaking, also attribute (part of the) success of some developing countries to
legal institutions. However, others (more particularly Ulen) point at the fact that legal rules may play some
role, but perhaps only a modest role in economic development. A powerful example which is quoted in that
respect is the one of China which, at least at first blush, does not seem to rely strongly on legal institutions
(at least in the traditional sense) and nevertheless has experienced a spectacular economic growth. The
particular case of China hence remains somewhat puzzling in this debate. So far, these various streams of
literature paying attention to the question to what extent legal origins matter for economic growth have not
been strongly integrated and have, to a large extent, been developed in separate social sciences (institutional
economics, development economics, and comparative law). This multi-disciplinary book brings these
approaches together in an integrated and structural manner. (Series: Ius Commune Europaeum - Vol. 100)
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From reader reviews:

Matthew Dealba:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content.
As we know that book is very important normally. The book Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic
Growth (Ius Commune Europaeum) has been making you to know about other understanding and of course
you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The book Does Law Matter?: On Law and
Economic Growth (Ius Commune Europaeum) is not only giving you more new information but also being
your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to
make relationship together with the book Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic Growth (Ius Commune
Europaeum). You never really feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Pam Boyd:

Here thing why this kind of Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic Growth (Ius Commune Europaeum)
are different and trusted to be yours. First of all reading a book is good but it really depends in the content of
computer which is the content is as delightful as food or not. Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic
Growth (Ius Commune Europaeum) giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any
guide out there but there is no book that similar with Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic Growth (Ius
Commune Europaeum). It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing that
happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere
like in park, café, or even in your means home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the
printed book maybe the form of Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic Growth (Ius Commune
Europaeum) in e-book can be your alternate.

Cynthia Campbell:

This book untitled Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic Growth (Ius Commune Europaeum) to be one
of several books in which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot
of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail store or you can order it through online.
The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read
this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Maryann Warren:

The book Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic Growth (Ius Commune Europaeum) will bring that you
the new experience of reading a book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. If you try to find
new book to see, this book very ideal to you. The book Does Law Matter?: On Law and Economic Growth
(Ius Commune Europaeum) is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from your
official web site, so you can easier to read the book.
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